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Project Description: 
 
Noble Excavating Inc. completed this fast 

paced multi faceted project under a joint venture 
with Wm. Winkler Company.  Per request by 
Spokane International this two year project was 
accelerated to be completed in one construction 
season.  The owner was very pleased when the 
project was completed one month ahead of the 
accelerated schedule. 

Noble Excavating’s portion of TRC 1 
involved the demolition of the existing terminal 
ramp.  This included 33,000 SY of 16 inch thick 
concrete paving, 12,000 SY of bituminous concrete 
pavement, and various other items.  When this was 
complete 32,000 CY was excavated from the site to 
make room for the 18,000 CY of crushed base 
course and meet the new lines and grades.  To 
facilitate drainage approximately 5,500 LF of PVC 
under drain was installed along with 1,500 LF of RCP 
storm drain, and a multitude of precast drainage 
inlets.  Before the new concrete paving could be 
completed we performed 44,000 SY of fine grading 
and compaction.  All work was completed to very 
stringent FAA specifications implementing the latest 
in GPS technology. 

This project was completed while keeping 
the airport operational and following the strict 

security guidelines without incident.  Throughout 
this project the owner was very impressed with the 
speed, accuracy, and end product provided by our 
team. 
 

 

 

 

Owner: Spokane International Airport 

            9000 West Airport Drive #204 

            Spokane, WA  99224 

            (509) 455-6413 
       Contact: Matt Breen, Construction Manager 
 

Engineer: Reynolds, Smith & Hills, Inc. 
       Contact: Jeffrey J. Warkoski, P.E. 
  
General Contractor: Noble Excavating Inc, WM Winkler Co. 

 Project Manager – Chris Bache 

 Superintendent – Eric Drake 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

Spokane International Airport TRC 1 

Spokane, Washington 
 

Contract Amount: $8,055,000.00 

Completion Date: November 2009 


